
    Formal tenders   - September 2021 

TENDER NUMBER ED 416 

Description 

STREET LIGHTING AND HIGH MAST MAINTENANCE 

ON MAIN ROADS, HIGHWAY AND RESIDENTIAL 

AREAS IN BCMM FOR A PERIOD OF 3 YEARS  

Closing date 3 SEPTEMBER 2021 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 
SIYA AND AYA ENGINEERING SECTION A:  

R 3 731 750.00 

 
 SECTION B :  

R 3 731 750.00 

 
 SECTION C: 

R 2 645 00.00 

   

2 
KOMANI, MIKUWO SECTION A : 

R 4 603 689.20 

 
 SECTION B: 

R 3 538 053.20 

 
 SECTION C: 

R 3 444 480.00 

   

3 

NDIYABTHANDA SECTION A: 
R 4 000 000.00 

 

 
 SECTION B: 

R 3 000 000.00 

 
 SECTION C: 

R3 000 000.00 

   

4 
SNR SECTION A: 

R 11 022 285.00 

 
 SECTION B: 

R 10 629 641.93 

  SECTION C:NO BID 

   

5 
BTE SALES AND PROJECTS SECTION A: 

R 124 500 000.00 

 
 SECTION B : 

R 116 800 000.00 

  SECTION C: NO BID 

   

6 LENADO EGINEERING SECTION A: NO BID 

  SECTION B: NO BID 

 
 SECTION C:  

R 5 903 333.34 

   

7 INSTELEC SECTION A:  



R 18 266 837.66 

 

 SECTION B ELEVEN 
THOUSAND,THREE HUNDRED 

AND SIXTY FOUR 
THOUSAND,SIX HUNDRED   
AND NINETY TWO RANDS 
FIFTY CENTS(IN WORDS): 

R 11 364 692.40 

 
 SECTION C : 

R 2 651 2536.84 

   

8 
DELACOM SECTION A : 

R 11 582 896.60 

 
 SECTION B: 

R 8 524 683.20 

  SECTION C : NO BID 

   

9  ATD POWER SOLUTION SECTION A: NO BID 

 
 SECTION B:  

R 506 000.00 

  SECTION C : NO BID 

   

10 
EUREMARO SECTION A:  

R 17 996 884.39 

 

 SECTION B; 
R 11 196 741.28 

 

 
 SECTION C: 

R 2 612 056.00 

   

11 
IKAGENG SECTION A: 

R  153 886.35 

 
 SECTION B: 

R153 886.35 

  SECTION C: NO BID 

   

12 
RISIMA SECTION A: 

R 7 137 820.00 

 
 SECTION B:  

R 4 275 228.50 

  SECION C :NO BID 

   

13 
KGOSHI SECTION A:  

R18 744 474.90 

 
 SECTION B : 

R 11 271 680.88 

 
 SECTION C: 

R 2 725 158.02 

   

14 CAPITAL POWER PROJECTS SECTION A: 



R 6 246 982.32 
 

 
 SECTION B; 

R 5 152 638.85 

  SECTION C : NO BID 

   

15 
PHUMELELA SECTION A:  

R 8 070 0636.54 

 
 SECTION B: 

R 4 857 054.24 

 
 SECTION C :  

R 4 848 562.08 

   

16 
LBV CONSULTING SECTION A: 

R4   574 341.20 

 
 SECTIONB: 

R 3 203 890.80 

  SECTION C;NO BID 

   

17 DESIGNER LIGHTING SECTION A: NO BID 

  SECTION B: NO BID 

  SECTION C: NO BID 

   

18 
AMPCOR KHANYISA SECTION A :  

R31 207 702.20 

 
 SECTION B :  

R 23 084 368.15 

  SECTION C : R 5 134 21.27 

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 
 
18 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER ED 409 

Description Electricity Tariff Restructuring for Buffalo City 

Metropolitan Municipality  

Closing date 3 SEPTEMBER 2021 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 CARIFRO R 2 944 000.00 

2 EYA BANTU GROUP R 786 600.00 

3 CDR  ELECTRICAL R 4 513 750.00 

4 
AKHILE MANAGEMENT & 
CONSULTING 

R 6 550 825.00 

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 4  

 



 

 

TENDER NUMBER C3212 

Description 

A SERVICE PROVIDER TO PROVIDE SERVICES TO 

DESIGN, CONSTRUCT , SUPPLY , DELIVER AND 

INSTALL A BRONZE STATUE OF ARCHBISHOP 

DESMOND MPILO TUTU IN A SITTING POSITION IN 

FRONT OF THE CITY HALL  

Closing date 3 SEPTEMBER 2021 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 GILDANE R 821 847.50 

2 LFD R 764 347.50 

TOTAL BID RECEIVED 2  

 


