
July Annuals 2020 

TENDER NUMBER CE 388 

Description 

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE COMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR 

BCMM (MOBILE DATA CARDS, DATA SIMS AND BULK SMS FACILITY) 

FOR APERIOD OF TWO (2) YEARS 

Date of advert 12 JUNE 2020 

Closing date 14 JULY  2020 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 VODACOM R 4 410 829.51 

2 AVNG INVESTMENTS R 3 111 949.79 

3 NOLITHA QUKULA R 705 076.00 

4 MIHLEKUTHI TRADING R 9 872 608.77 

5 TELKOM SA R 3 905 975.00 

6 ROCKY TRADING R 6 252 608.00 

7 
WORTHY TRADE 91 NO PRICE ON FORM OF 

OFFER 

8 NUTICRAFT R 3 014 036.61 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 
 08 
 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 222 

Description SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CLEANING MATERIAL AND EQUIPMENT 

TO BCMM FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (3) YEARS 

Date of advert 12 JUNE 2020 

Closing date 21 JULY 2020 

Number of bids Name of Bidder  Price Quoted 

1 
6 BROTHERS GUARDING 
SOLUTIONS 

A R 59 139 432.00 

  B R 21 592 383.12 

  C R 5 447 507 

  D R 142 596 480.00 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

2 ALUCRON A R 59 550 122.50 

  B R 21 443 470.13 

  C R 5 485 336.95 

  D R 141 613 056.00 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

3 AYAKHA 222 PROJECTS A R 32 043 772.00 



  B R 5 588 080.00 

  C R 3 434 088.34 

  D R 207 331 200.00 

  E R 1 141 490.00 

4 NDALI GENERAL TRADING A R 40 064 693.13 

  B R 14 225 788.75 

  C R 4 105 062.50 

  D R 255 060 000.00 

  E R 1 343 750.00 

    

5 MKHONTO WETHU TRADING A R 825 1584.98 

  B R 13 052 401.33 

  C R 3 591 567.66 

  D R 171 328 639.14 

  E R 1 781 897.57 

    

6 KIKI HOLDINGS A R 13 064 065.00 

  B R 79 640 70.50 

  C R 49 793 50.00 

  D R 214 000.00 

  E R 17 670 00.00 

    

7 BRAND AWAY  A R 71 124 53.00 

  B R 113 296 79.50 

  C R 303 494 9.50 

  D R 121 305 600.00 

  E R 90 6190.00 

    

8 KHULA STATIONERY AGENCIES A R 4 340.00 

  B R 4 548.85 

  C R 17 08.83 

  D R 614.91 

  E R 3 603.30 

    

9 LULUSIVUCA A R 7 310 936.50 

  B R 4 224 262.82 

  C R 8 585 074.54 

  D R 27 720 095.00 

  E R 1 399 075.00 

    

10 SQUEEKY CLEAN A R 32 834 700.00 

  B R 10 204 260.00 

  C R 2 752 700.00 

  D R 2 277 600.00 

  E R 1 152 400.00 

    

11 GILBERT CIVILS A R 7 896 549.75 

  B R 6 825 439.55 

  C R 4 171 395.00 

  D R 258 091 795.00 



  E R 1 609 307.70 

    

12 INVESTOREX 28 A R 9 559 915.50 

  B R 13 545 157.70 

  C R 3 068 448.97 

  D R 156 127 680.00 

  E R 828 180.55 

    

13 
ZIPHOZIHLE SECURITY & 
CLEANING 

A R 44 685 243.00 

  B R 9 883 097.50 

  C R 3 271 028.00 

  D R 77 579 840.00 

  E R 1 106 443.25 

    

14 BIG SKY TRADING 401 A R 8 345 421.50 

  B R 5 185 677.50 

  C R 1 113 152.00 

  D R 24 739 200.00 

  E R 1 018 297.00 

    

15 KJSS GROUP A R 31 127 000.00 

  B R 32 293 000.00 

  C R 8 574 500.00 

  D R 15 574 500.00 

  E R 3 172 500.00 

    

16 ALCARI 303 A R 9 365 697.00 

  B R 9 288 720.00 

  C R 2 642 160.00 

  D R 98 342 400.00 

  E R 1 212 165.00 

    

17 PLATINUM SUPPLIERS A R 6 835 424.00 

  B R 8 286 800.00 

  C R 2 295 200.00 

  D R 129 801 600.00 

  E R 636 595.00 

    

18 SOMILANGAYE TRADING A R 13 693 782.00 

  B R 22 843 586.00 

  C R 10 479 100.00 

  D R 194 582 400.00 

  E R 1 574 000.00 

    

19 HINTSABE TRADING A R 7 990 177.27 

  B R 11 182 132.21 

  C R 4 907 628.28 

  D R 151 264 052.16 

  E R 1 127 567.87 



    

20 SMASH BOOI TRAVEL A R 8 112 175.00 

  B R 6 672 708.00 

  C R 3 220 650.00 

  D R 136 608 000.00 

  E R 1 077 750.00 

    

21 LETECH A R 6 606 618.90 

  B R 12 468 565.08 

  C R 3 926 650.85 

  D R 127 410 984.00 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

22 SOPHOLA GENERAL TRADING A R 6 858 664.40 

  B R 7 890 069.50 

  C R 3 508 132.50 

  D R 207 066 240.00 

  E R 1 391 914.00 

    

23 REVOLUTION OF UBUNTU A R 39 554 771.50 

  B R 12 204 369.00 

  C R 3 613 970.00 

  D R 1 147 950.00 

  E R 21 926 400.00 

    

24 YAMZA SOLUTIONS A R 23 043 685.00 

  B R 107 422.00 

  C R 275 8300.50 

  D R 150 691 200.00 

  E R 803 172.00 

    

25 ELAND PROJECTS A R 24 479 500.00 

  B R 9 023 700.00 

  C R 4 128 250.00 

  D R 159 168 000.00 

  E R 1 150 750.00 

    

26 NO LIMITS TRADING A R 37 070 561.88 

  B R 11 584 297.53 

  C R 3 915 202.14 

  D R 188 187 840.00 

  E R 1 058 226.78 

    

27 EBUSHA GENERAL TRADING A R 8 548 643.82 

  B R 12 700 324.14 

  C R 3 171 114.21 

  D R 108 608 064.00 

  E R 893 543.59 

    

28 AMINA CHEM A R 9 030 370.00 



  B R 9 150 470.00 

  C R 3 021 640.00 

  D R 133 036 800.00 

  E R 1 139 210.00 

29 LINTO DEVELOPERS A R 6 741 150.00 

  B R 8 057 850.00 

  C R 3 804 350.00 

  D R 156 480 000.00 

  E R 633 000.00 

    

30 ANAM AND FATHER A R 7 267 250.00 

  B R 19 246 540.00 

  C R 3 472 750.00 

  D R 166 636 800.00 

  E R 1 069 650.00 

    

31 NOLITHA QUKULA GOLD A R 28 681 650.00 

  B R 14 679 670.00 

  C R 5 573 260.00 

  D R 124 854 912.00 

  E R 3 258 660.00 

    

32 RIOSIN A R 27 314 400.00 

  B R 120 111 00.00 

  C R 3 195 050.00 

  D R 170 976 000.00 

  E R 913 450.00 

    

33 SIYAXHATHISA TRADING A R 8 803 453.00 

  B R 10 641 861.00 

  C R 3 690 851.00 

  D R 227 031 936.00 

  E R 1 578 199.00 

    

34 LOYD & BONG 8227 A R 6 347 100.00 

  B R 11 766 060.00 

  C R 3 707 000.00 

  D R 148 032 000.00 

  E R 1 339 850.00 

    

35 ZN SIHOLA TRADING A R 21 172 470.20 

  B R 13 828 205.00 

  C R 5 681 993.83 

  D R 192 612 288.00 

  E R 922 698.29 

    

36 KFC ENGINEERING A R 30 395 409.99 

  B R 13 779 074.99 

  C R 3 054 079.99 

  D R 133 775 999.99 



  E R 1 104 309.99 

    

37 BLAWA SERVICE A R 6 076 400.00 

 
 

 B R 7 686 650.00 

  C R 3 219 750.00 

  D R 194 688 000.00 

  E R 1 120 750.00 

    

38 LITYE ONE PROJECTS A R 17 267 497.00 

  B R 17 474 256.00 

  C R 4 854 507.30 

  D R 7 499 672.80 

  E R 2 054 135.40 

    

39 KEIKE TRADING A R 55 638 261.00 

  B R 13 128 304.50 

  C R 4 828 308.00 

  D R 238 760 640.00 

  E R 1 844 930.00 

    

40 NONTEMBISO PROJECTS A R 46 597 942.50 

  B R 12 801 282.73 

  C R 2 896 516.50 

  D R 224 832 912.00 

  E R 1 680 173.00 

    

41 AZENOPHAWU TRADING A R 19 553 050.00 

  B R 8 241 030.00 

  C R 2 270 580.00 

  D R 1 849 600.00 

  E R 899 550.00 

    

42 LO NJOLOZA HOLDINGS A R 44 088 415.00 

  B R 8 388 514.60 

  C R 4 078 542.50 

  D R 243 081 600.00 

  E R 788 396.50 

    

43 UZ DEVELOPERS A R 30 541 400.00 

  B R 24 760 632.00 

  C R 4 368 895.00 

  D R 190 070 400.00 

  E R 1 303 900.00 

    

44 STAMENTE TRADING A R 2 2711 730.00 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D R 218 976 000.00 

  E NO BID PRICE 



    

45 CAPSTONE 1248 A R 9 057 490.00 

  B R 17 797 385.00 

  C R 2 747 785.00 

  D R 168 249 600.00 

  E R 860 090.00 

    

46 PAPER BACK SHACK A R 6 646 356.00 

  B R 9 754 351.75 

  C R 3 967 362.00 

  D R 225 094.560.00 

  E R 968 397.75 

    

47 ALUPHELI TRADING A R 15 967 002.50 

  B R 5 822 417.50 

  C R 2 553 632.50 

  D R 14 790 840.00 

  E R 957 812.00 

    

48 GADALAMI TRADING A R 17 307 615.00 

  B R 12 835 150.00 

  C R 5 294 082.50 

  D R 235 152 000.00 

  E R 1 369 362.50 

    

49 LUNGISA A R 12 692 918.00 

  B R 10 604 357.00 

  C R 41 693 552.50 

  D R 11 227 277.50 

  E R 63 652.50 

    

50 RURAL AFRICA A R 38 929 019.00 

  B R 12 451 189.00 

  C R 3 024 946.00 

  D R 89 214 848.00 

  E R 880 689.00 

    

51 DAMITA HOLDINGS A R 2 789 235.00 

  B R 2 838 172.50 

  C R 1 234 993.75 

  D R 3 227 .98 

  E R 1 716 900.00 

    

52 INKUNZI INVESTMENT A R 6 653 899.50 

  B R 8 674 990.50 

  C R 3 208 624.50 

  D R 4 296 768.00 

  E R 921 761.00 

    



53 
MALISWANA TRADING 
ENTERPRISE 

A R 19 643 700.00 

  B R 14 809 610.00 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D R 166 127 232.00 

  E R 892 850.00 

    

54 AVNG INVESTMENTS A R 8 024 006.88 

  B R 6 626 644.90 

  C R 4 207 303.08 

  D R 166 022 592.00 

  E R 965 766.34 

    

55 SONGELWA DLAMINI A R 31 112 687.50 

  B R 7 267 871.00 

  C R 2 675 058.50 

  D R 133 102 080.00 

  E R 537 426.00 

    

56 IMVUKO HOLDINGS A R 23 386 312.50 

  B R 8 417 531.50 

  C R 4 218 018.00 

  D R 4 905 248.00 

  E R 1 034 618.50 

    

57 CHANGE CONSULTING A NO BID PRICE 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D R 105 244 800.00 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

58 
PINKY 233 TRADING & 
ELECTRICAL 

A R 53 796 487.00 

  B R 6 103 900.00 

  C R 28 939 709.00 

  D R 433 087 680.00 

  E R 1 915 783.00 

    

59 HELCO PROJECT MANAGEMENT A R 681 117.00 

  B R 8 657 097.00 

  C R 3 441 410.50 

  D R 8 716 3000.00 

  E R 622 969.00 

    

60 
MASUKWINI AMHLE A FORM OF OFFER 

INCOMPLETE 

 
 B FORM OF OFFER 

INCOMPLETE 

 
 C FORM OF OFFER 

INCOMPLETE 



 
 D FORM OF OFFER 

INCOMPLETE 

 
 E FORM OF OFFER 

INCOMPLETE 

    

61 GREAT MIND HOLDINGS A NO BID PRICE 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D NO BID PRICE 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

62 KHAYONE DEVELOPMENT A R 7 458 625.00 

  B R 5 243 873.00 

  C R 23 734 350.00 

  D R 232 308 730.00 

  E R 769 655.00 

    

63 SAMUNITE A R 39 675 700.00 

  B R 7 431 410.00 

  C R 3 774 700.00 

  D R 4 761 600.00 

  E R 1 702 400.00 

    

64 DAMFIN GENERAL TRADING A R 8 843 800.00 

  B R 12 443 000.00 

  C R 4 514 000.00 

  D R 122 688 000.00 

  E R 1 628 500.00 

    

65 LULONGA COMMUNICATIONS A R 6 169 488.00 

  B R 8 547 872.60 

  C R 3 167 668.50 

  D R 4 432 424.00 

  E R 1 205 916.50 

    

66 TAM TEE BUSINESS A R 22 150 850.00 

  B R 8 394 650.00 

  C R 3 908 300.00 

  D R 151 430 460.00 

  E R 1 137 200.00 

    

67 BLUE RAIN TRADING 48 A R 7 366 801.50 

  B R 3 840 204.00 

  C R 10 807 094.00 

  D R 140 160 000.00 

  E R 775 625.00 

    

68 NAMEERA TRADING A R 11 202 190.00 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 



  D R 3 740 000.00 

  E R 1 594 150.00 

    

69 IYANA GENERAL TRADING A R 639 600.00 

  B R 204 777 600.00 

  C R 3 764 850.00 

  D R 159 638 20.00 

  E R 42 309 800.00 

    

70 XWENGA MIHLE TRADING A NO BID PRICE 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D NO BID PRICE 

  E NO BID PRICE 

    

71 KEIKE TRADING A R 55 638 261.00 

  B R 13 128 304.50 

  C R 4 828 308.00 

  D R 238 760 640.00 

  E R 1 844 930.00 

    

72 AYABONA CONSTRUCTION A R 21 359 719.50 

  B R 10 225 244.50 

  C R 5 099 310.00 

  D R 139 008 000.00 

  E R 1 315 000.00 

    

73 
MAMBOMBO CLEANING & 
HEALTH 

A R 4 181 410.00 

  B R 3 529 230.00 

  C R 2 191 776.00 

  D R 1 833 600.00 

  E R 450 965.00 

    

74 AFRO LIVE LINE CONTRACTOR A R 24 160 522.00 

  B R 9 287 055.00 

  C 2 588 937.50 

  D R 135 758 880.00 

  E R 1 679 000.00 

    

75 PAKAMA GENERAL TRADING A R 38 803 201.00 

  B R 26 645 170.00 

  C R 10 717 150.00 

  D R 168 673 12.00 

  E R 10 589 00.00 

    

76 LFD PROJECTS A R 6 778 358.35 

  B R 7 241 872.23 

  C R 3 116 337.46 

  D R 202 698 387.65 



  E R 499 797.77 

    

77 BESSIE PROJECTS 87 A R 12 232 860.00 

  B R 8 847 954.10 

  C R 4 781 063.00 

  D R 191 692 800.00 

  E R 2 070 913.00 

    

78 INAMQWABE TRADERS A R 6 385 172.00 

  B R 9 357 450.00 

  C R 3 691 750.00 

  D R 14 630 400.00 

  E R 1 340 300.00 

    

79 KHAZIMLA AGENCIES A R 7 693 672.50 

  B R 22 505 684.00 

  C R 2 366 309.00 

  D R 200 090 064.00 

  E R 1 438 404.50 

    

80 MASIQHAME TRADING 520 A R 9 943 650.00 

  B R 9 840 540.00 

  C R 2 782 250.00 

  D R 110 400 000.00 

  E R 1 258 250.00 

    

81 DEVINE WATCH SECURITY A NO BID PRICE 

  B NO BID PRICE 

  C NO BID PRICE 

  D NO BID PRICE 

  E R 247 422 350.50 

    

82 HG CONSULTANTS A R 6 885 858.00 

  B R 9 302 840.00 

  C R 3 720 294.00 

  D R 161 616 000.00 

  E R 1 195 000.00 

    

83 LIVENI & LUVANO TRADING A R 9 309 150.00 

  B R 5 651 080.00 

  C R 3 444 300.00 

  D R 4 320 000.00 

  E R 517 700.00 

    

84 NUTIERATE A R 5 194 713.30 

  B R 4 048 322.25 

  C R 2 568 905.33 

  D R 158 356 800.00 

  E R 589 742.25 

    



85 H KARSON COMMODITIES A R 5 406 729.00 

  B R 5 542 305.00 

  C R 1 144 730.00 

  D R 190 828 800.00 

  E R 1 070 370.00 

86 MATIGNA AGENCIES A R 6 724 450.00 

  B R 19 621 930.00 

  C R 3 215 800.00 

  D R 172 080 000.00 

 
 

 E R 1 414 000.00 

    

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 
86 

 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 390 

Description SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BLACK REFUSE BAGS TO BCMM FOR A 

PERIOD OF THREE (3) YEARS 

Date of advert 12 JUNE 2020 

Closing date 21 JULY 2020 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 GQOBO INVESTMENTS R 474 375.00 

2 BUBEDE MULTI SERVICES R 141 570 000.00 

3 BIG SKY TRADING 401 R 12 647 700.00 

4 LUKHALOMSO INVESTMENTS R 94 711 815.00 

5 MASIQHAME TRADING 520 R 41 112 500.00 

6 HEICO PROJECT MANAGEMENT R 17325.00 

7 MASALAMAHLE TRADING R 34 594 300.00 

8 ALCARI 303 R 45 448 000.00 

9 TMAC DISTRIBUTION R 21 775 000.00 

10 
INKOBI CONSTRUCTION & 
SUPPLY 

R 63 713 000.00 

11 KHT 003 PROJECTS R 42 926 000.00 

12 ZIMIMBO PROJECTS R 18 564 000.00 

13 NOLITHA QUKULA R 6 930 000.00 

14 SILVER SOLUTIONS 1522 R 37 703 900.00  

15 CHANGA CONSULTING R 28 054 000.00 

16 GILBERT CIVILS R 179 370 675.00 

17 LITHOTECH SALES R 51 577 500.00 

18 BLUE RAIN TRADING 48 R 46 718 750.00  

19 
GOOD FUTURE TRADING & 
PROJECTS 

R 49 364 900.00 



20 MKEKO TRADING ENTERPRISE R 43 245 000.00 

21 
NCILIMADU TRADING & 
INVESTMENT 

R 455 400 000.00 

22 ZIPHOZIHLE SECURITY R 56 430 000.00 

23 
LETHULULO TRADING 
ENTERPRISE 

R 47 025 000.00 

24 RURAL AFRICA R 48 262 400.00 

25 POWER SPINKS INVESTMENT R 42 704 675.00 

26 NEWBREED HOLDINGS R 38 588 192.50 

27 KHOTSO NXELE R 99 118 500.00 

28 
MALISWANA TRADING 
ENTERPRISE 

R 66 700 920.00 

29 
LUSASHANA BUILDING 
CONTRACTOR 

R 16 155 315.00 

30 INGCAMBU PROJECTS R 35 490 000.00 

31 NGUTA MABE SOLUTIONS R 92 812 500.00 

32 CLASSIC PLASTICS R 133 204 500.00 

33 SILVERPLAS R 87 664 500.00 

34 KOMANI M TRADING R 42 926 000.00 

35 BYXICEL R 37 180 000.00 

36 KHAZIMLA AGENCIES R 128 271 000.00 

37 L2K  R 74 241 700.00 

38 INVESTOREX 28 R 96 696 600.00 

39 SONYUKO HOLDINGS R 146 850 000.00 

40 
FIRM EARLY CONSTRUCTION & 
BUILDING 

R 93 926 250.00 

41 
KHULA STATIONERY AGENCIES & 
CONSULTANTS 

R 1228.20 

42 CAPSTONE 1248 R 118 187 685.00 

43 
ELAND PROJECTS AND 
CONSULTING 

R 130 343 400.00 

44 SOPHOLA GENERAL TRADING R 23 920 000.00 

45 NONTEMBISO PROJECTS R 113 470 500.00 

46 EZULUWENI CONSTRUCTION R 122 646 810.00 

47 YAMZA SOLUTION R 133 320 000.00 

48 TSCH INTERNATIONAL HOLDINGS R 38 092 600.00  

49 MASIKHULILE TRADING R 97 886 250.00 

50 CRD SOLUTIONS R 127 284 300.00 

51 INAMQWABE TRADING R 198 000 000.00 

52 SIYAKUDUMISA DISTRIBUTORS R 43 550 000.00 

53 MALIGRA AGENCIES R 115 830 000.00 

54 MALIMISO PROJECTS R 53 251 900.00 

55 AFRO LIVE LINE CONTRACTOR R 7590.00 

56 AVNG INVESTMENTS R 41 860 000.00 

57 LEO & SONS R 9 490 000.00 

58 ANAM & FATHER TRADING R 110 682 000.00 

59 NO LIMIT TRADING ENTERPRISE R 48 482 880.00 

60 SAKHAKHAYA SUPPLIERS R 97 269 645.00 

61 SAFIKA GUNDLE R 33 039 500.00 

62 BESSIE PROJECTS 89 R 61 750 000.00  



63 MEMOTEK TRADING  R 98 423 325.00 

64 NUTICRAFT  NO BID PRICE 

65 RKC HOLDING R 9 717 500.00 

66 LIVENI AND LUVANO TRADING R 12 122 500.00 

67 KFC ENGINEERING & INDUSTRIAL R 104 362 500.00 

68 DAMITA TRADING  R 3 071 250.00 

69 CANZONET HADDPACK  R 105 105 000.00 

70 AMENDED RECLINE TRADING R 41 112 50.00 

71 MPUMAPHONDO PROJECTS R 87 009 000.00 

72 LETECH R 41 770 300.00 

73 TAMTEE BUSINESS SOLUTIONS R 134 308 350.00 

74 GQABS TRADING NO BID PRICE 

75 LFM CONSULTANTS R 64 808 250.00 

76 SAKHIKHAYA SUPPLIERS R 38 122 500.00 

77 WELCONY INVESTMENTS R 141 363 750.00 

78 PLATINUM SUPPLIERS R 173 250.00 

79 RIOSIN R 123 250.00 

80 SESONA ENTERPRISE R 53 640 600.00 

81 MASIQHAME TRADING R 49 400 000.00 

82 BUDDY PLASTICS & TRADING R 38 309 375.00 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 
82 

 

 


