   
  December Annuals 2019 

	TENDER NUMBER
	BCMM/DDP/TPO/1508/2019

	Description
	
PROVISION OF TRANSPORT SPECIALIST SERVICES TO ASSIST BCMM WITH TRANSPORT INDUSTRY TRANSITION PLANNING, NEGOTIATION AND IMPLEMENTATION PHASE FOR THE INTEGRATED PUBLIC TRANSPORT NETWORK PLAN(IPTN).

	Date of advert
	[bookmark: _GoBack]22 November 2019

	Closing date
	06 December 2019


	Number of bids
	Name of Bidder
	
	Price Quoted

	1
	AURECON SA
	SHEDULE 1
	NO BID PRICE

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 6 988 677.70

	
	
	
	

	2
	AM CONSULTING ENGINEERS
	SHEDULE 1
	NO BID PRICE

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 18 232 626.33

	
	
	
	

	3
	DELTA SYSTEMS
	SHEDULE 1
	R 19 981 940.00

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 12 523 500.00

	
	
	
	

	4
	FUTURE OF TRANSPORT
	SHEDULE 1
	R 3 478 750.00

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	NO BID PRICE

	
	
	
	

	5
	SMEC SOUTH AFRICA
	SHEDULE 1
	R 1 752 710.40

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 2 063 376.00

	
	
	
	

	6
	BLACKTOP CIVILS
	SHEDULE 1
	R 1 999 968.00

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 2 082 561.42

	
	
	
	

	7
	MAFUMU CONSULTING
	SHEDULE 1
	R 3 777 796.00

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	R 4 309 096.00

	
	
	
	

	8
	SIYAZITHULA TRANSPORTATION
	SHEDULE 1
	R 5 110 840.35

	
	
	SHEDULE 2
	NO BID PRICE

	TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED
	
08
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TENDER NUMBER  BCMM/DDP/TPO/1508/2019  

Description    PROVISION OF TRANSPORT SPECIALIST SERVICES TO ASSIST BCMM  WITH TRANSPORT INDUSTRY TRANSITION PLANNING, NEGOTIATION  AND IMPLEMENTATION PHASE FOR THE  INTEGRATED PUBLIC  TRANSPORT NETWORK PLAN(IPTN).  

Date of advert  22 November   2019  

Closing date  0 6   December   2019  

Number of bids  Name of Bidder   Price Quoted  

1  AURECON SA  SHEDULE 1  NO BID PRICE  

  SHEDULE 2  R 6 988 677.70  

    

2  AM CONSULTING  ENGINEERS  SHEDULE 1  NO BID PRICE  

  SHEDULE 2  R 18 232 626.33  

    

3  DELTA SYSTEMS  SHEDULE 1  R 19 981 940.00  

  SHEDULE 2  R 12 523 500.00  

    

4  FUTURE OF  TRANSPORT  SHEDULE 1  R 3 478 750.00  

  SHEDULE 2  NO BID PRICE  

    

5  SMEC SOUTH AFRICA  SHEDULE 1  R 1 752 710.40  

  SHEDULE 2  R 2 063 376.00  

    

6  BLACKTOP CIVILS  SHEDULE 1  R 1 999 968.00  

  SHEDULE 2  R 2 082 561.42  

    

7  MAFUMU  CONSULTING  SHEDULE 1  R 3 777 796.00  

  SHEDULE 2  R 4 309 096.00  

    

8  SIYAZITHULA  TRANSPORTATION  SHEDULE 1  R 5 110 840.35  

  SHEDULE 2  NO BID PRICE  

TOTAL BIDS  RECEIVED    08    

 

