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TENDER NUMBER CE 346 

Description SUPPORT AND MAINTENANCE OF A VOIP (VOICE OVER INTERNET 

PROTOCOL) ENABLED PABX TELEPHONE SYSTEM FOR THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 18 October 2019 

Closing date 01 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 OPEN COMMUNICATION R 2 777 646.75 

2 NASHUA COMMUNICATIONS R 6 432 216.80 

3 ZIKHALI TECHNOLOGIES R 6 429 862.75 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 03 
 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 364 

Description 

SUPPLY, DELIVERY INSTALLATION IMPLEMENTATION TRAINING 

MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT OF A PARKING MANAGEMENT SYSTEM 

FOR BCMM 

Date of advert 01 October 2019 

Closing date 01 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 VISUAL SUPERMARKET 60%  

2 MIHLEKUTHI 50% 

3 DONTUNETICS R 22 004 100 (80%) 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 03 
 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 71 

Description 

INSTALLATION OF MINIATURE SUBSTATIONS, RINGMAIN UNITS AND 

SUBSTATION EQUIPMENT PANEL OF THREE SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR 

A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 04 October 2019 

Closing date 05 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 DEVTECH R 989 276.00 

2 JEB POWER PROJECTS R 566 156.50 

3 MVELAHOVE JV R 607 832.50 

4 YANDE ENGINREERING R 1 083 640.52  

5 TSHUVANE SERVICES R 522 925.13 

6 SHANE’S ELECTRICAL R 602 513.75 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 06 
 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 370 

Description 

INSTALLATION OF MINIATURE SUBSTATIONS, RINGMAIN UNITS AND 

SUBSTATION EQUIPMENT PANEL OF THREE SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR 

A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 11 October 2019 

Closing date 15 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 DAMFIN GENERAL TRADING R 1 071 800.00 

2 SQUEECKY CLEAN NO PRICE ON FORM OF OFFER 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 02 
 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 144 

Description PROVISON OF FENCING OF BCMM INFRASTRUCTURE FOR A PERIOD 

OF THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 11 October 2019 

Closing date 15 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 HYMAN MASTERFENCE A) R 2 730 399.00 

  B) R 589 329.00 

  C) R 3 577 949.00 

  D) R 1 696 577.75 

  E) R1 633 460.00 

  F A) R1 715 903 .50 

  F) B) R2 033 303.50 

  G) R164 553.50  

  H) R2631.20 

   

2 IMIVUZO TRADING A) R 3 759 378.18 

  B) R 518 750.63 

  C) R 7 275 270.88 

  D) R2 251 324.81 

  D) R746 286.75 

  F A) R 2 701 536.88 

                         F B) R 2 701 536.88 

  G) R 369 043.63 

    H) R166 635.00 

   

3 
ABAQULISI FINANCE 
ADVISORS 

A) R 3 670 571.15 

  B) R 432 474.75 

  C) R 7 568 357.00 

  D) R 2 018 773.25 

  E) R 2 563 976.25 

   F A) R2 614 778.00 

  F B) R 2 014 367.60 

  G) R 350 776.45 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

   



4 
IMBUMBA DEVELOPMENT 
JV KYNETS 

A) R4 065 854.90 

  B) R 458 004.75 

  C) R1 819 047.00  

  D) R540 332.10 

  E) R1 408 911.00 

  F A) R3 504 044.25 

  F B) R3 504 044.25 

  G) R953 115.98 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

5 
EZULWENI 
CONSTRUCTION PTY LTD 

A) R3 727 223.23     

  B) R1 018 124.74 

  C) R3 846 887.75 

  D) R1 903 971.60 

  E) R1 396 929.71 

  F A) R2 264 420.41 

  F B) R 2 122 252.12 

  G) R530 771.47 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

6 
LUPHANU TRADING JV 
PMX 

A) R909 776.50 

  B) R231 646.50 

  C) R1 813 507.00 

  D) R2 526 607.50 

  E) R 1 107 881.20 

  F A) R205 625.75 

  F B) R199 346.75 

   G)R198 098.50 

  H) R99 372.50 

   

7 VADUBA INVESTMENTS A) R 3 094 161.25 

  B) R 523 313.02 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) R 1 733 423.75 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) R 1 676 700.00 

  F B) R 2 497 290.34 

  G) R 281 405.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

   

8 MOLATELATSO A) R3 189 373.20 

  B) R643 806.80 

  C) R5 734 097.80 

  D)618 633.05 

  E)268 996.25 

  F A) R2 006 676.91 



  F B) R2 045 613.31 

   G)R627 969.00 

  H) R78 200.00 

   

9 QWANDO LZK EZAMAZIZI A) R7 523 875.00 

  B) R4 340 732.00 

  C) R2 361 640.00 

  D) R1 334 000.00 

  E) R2 483 425.00 

  F A) R2 204 194.00 

  F B) R2 210 795.00 

  G) R423 505.44 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

10 
DAMFIN GENERAL 
TRADING 

A) R1 662 670.00 

  B) R1 369 420.00  

  C) R755 320.00 

  D) R612 720.00 

  E) R830 300.00 

  F A) R3 377 550.00 

  F B) R2 987 800.00 

  G) R872 620.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

11 
PHANDANI CONST.J.V 
ODWA 

A) R4 307 458.24 

  B) R 666 770.00 

  C) R4 269 927.00 

  D) R1 460 994.50 

  E) R1 006 911.20 

  F A) R1 371 777.50 

  F B) R502 377.50 

  G) R368 897.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

12 CIVIL & CONSTRUCTION JV A) R1 698 239.50 

  B) R614 617.50 

  C) R3 740 007.00 

  D) R1 050 653.00 

  E) R1 319 188.00 

  F A) R2 443 451.00 

  F B) R 2 443 451.00 

  G) R 438 702.00 

  H) R 11 295.30 

   

13 FISTOZ JV STRIVING MINDS A) 4 328 657.50 

  B) R 870 435.00 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 



  E) 2 319 205.00 

  F A) R 2 944 517.50 

  F B) 3 096 202.50 

  G) R 529 460.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

14 NLG GROUP A) R 3 606 734.65 

  B) R 542 058.25 

  C) R 4 300 350.25 

  D) R 1 478 779.25 

  E) 1 289 840.00 

  F A) R 1 999 476.25 

  F B) R 2 100 273.95 

  G) R 360 519.25 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

15 AGATHO TRADING 186 A) R 2 753 157.50 

  B) R 1 506 445.00 

  C) R 2 960 295.00 

  D) R 1 786 381.25 

  E) R 1 740 525.00 

  F A) R 4 397 404.50 

  F B) R 4 397 404.50 

  G) R 1 143 330.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

16 SEGABOKENG JV A) R 2 693 897.00 

  B) R 1 002 777.00 

  C) R 5 529 200.00 

  D) R 1 686 245.00 

  E) R 1 689 378.75 

  F A) R 2 128 383.00 

  F B) R 2 128 383.00 

  G) R 657 804.60 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

17 NED STEEL PTY (LTD) A) R 3 875 730.00 

  B) R 845 480.00 

  C) R4 180 020.00 

  D) R 2 821 755.00 

  E) R 3 304 180.00 

  F A) R 2 263 177.00 

  F B) 2 475 927.00 

  G) R 512 785.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

18 BOTANI CONSTRUCTION A) NO BID PRICE 

  B) NO BID PRICE 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 



  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

  F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) NO BID PRICE 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

19 
ZAMAR TECHNOLOGIES JV 
SKILLATCH A) R 2 275 605.00 

  B) R 533 755.00 

  C) R 5 645 850.00 

  D) R 1 893 515.00 

  E) R983 198.00 

  F A) R1 622 989.00 

  F B) R 1 622 989.00 

  G) R201 952.00 

  H) 289 954.00 

   

20 SPLIT BAR AGENCIES A) R 2 981 490.00 

  B) R 773 186.40 

  C) R 3 781 085.00 

  D) R 2 132 865.90 

  E) R 949 007.60 

  F A) R 2 643 557.90 

  F B) R 2 643 557.90  

  G) R 365 428.60 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

21 TODUKA JV A) R 227 257.25 

  B) R 359 364.75 

  C) R 1 454 662.25 

  D) R260 032.25 

  E) R 456 722.50 

  F A) R 1 373 715.25 

  F B) R 1 373 715.25 

  G) R 442 215.25 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

22 MFINGO FORMIT JV A) R 2 580 370.00 

  B) R 570 515.00 

  C) R 5 052 410.00 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) 2 686 975.00 

  F A) R 2 148 947.50 

  F B) 2 303 691.50 

  G) R 329 820.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

23 
SPLIT BAR AGENCIES JV 
ALOMNA A) R 2 625 864.00 

  B) R 752 171.30 



  C) R 3 604 523.20 

  D) R 1 592 948.40 

  E) R 1 086 253.20 

  F A) R 2 804 424.50 

  F B) R2 784 759.50 

  G) R385 254.60 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

24 SILIDI PROJECTS A) R 16 989 939.50 

  B) R16 989 939.50 

  C) R 16 989 939.50 

  D) NO PRICE 

  E) R 16 989 939.50 

               F(A) R 16 989 939.50 

  F B) R 16 989 939.50 

  G) R 16 989 939.50 

  H) R 16 989 939.50 

   

25 LEFITO TRADING 505 A) R 4 408 016.3O 

  B) R 2 055 934.68 

  C) R 5 598 269.50 

  D) R 3 815 630.10 

  E) R2 274 276 50 

  F A) R 3 318 726.65 

                   F B) R3 735 078.82 

  G) R 610 428.44 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

26 LILITHA LETHU TRAINING A) R 5 551 843.50 

  B) R 537 268 .50 

  C) R 13 086 643.50 

  D) R 3 078 193.50 

  E) R 879 405.00 

  F A) R 3 388 636.00 

  F B) R 3 393 236.00 

  G) R 514 268.50 

  H) R 30 429 494.50 

   

27 
ZKS PROJECTS JV DFM 
SECURITY 

R 1 257 479.00 

  R 1 257 479.00 

  R 3 360 633.50 

  R1 047 779.38 

  R 1 572 567.50 

                F A) R 1 257 479 .00 

                   F B) R 1 257 479.00 

  G) R 304 485.50 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

28 GOMELEMO PROJECTS JV A) NO BID PRICE 



  B) NO BID PRICE 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

                     F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) NO BID PRICE 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

29 
SQT CIVILS 
CONSTRUCTION 

A) NO BID PRICE 

                                     B) 17 693 892.75 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

        D)  BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

                          F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) NO BID PRICE 

                         H) NO BID PRICE 

   

30 
NOBANTU CONSTRUCTION 
TRADING 

A) R2 501 325.00 

  B) R 1 310 310.00 

  C) R 6 048 712.50 

  D) R 1 878 870.00 

  E) 5 612 575.00 

        F A) R 2 729 870.00 

  F B) R 2 618 320.00 

  G) R 567 065.00 

    H) R 23 267 547 

   

31 
BORDER KEI BUILDING & 
CIVILS 

      A) R 8 552 435.00 

     B) R 3 212 985.00 

                             C)R 17 643 185.00 

                 D) R 6 055 210.00 

          E)1 892 900.00 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

                     F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) R 1 165 410.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

32 MIHLEKUTHI AFRISEC JR A) R 3 733 665.90 

  B) R 622 757.20 

  C) R 4 479 537.50 

  D) 2 088 653.00 

  E) R 2 570 537.50 

  F A) R 2 219 264.25 

              F B) R 2 522 660.50 

                                    G) R 604 261.75 



  H) R 122 130.00 

   

33 BLUE MARINE JV                   A) R 3 709 882.57 

  B) R 632 867.52 

  C) R 4 869 882.69 

  D) R 1 774 866.90 

  E) R 2 510 133.75 

               F A) R 2 753 394.99 

  F B) R 3 180 982.74 

                                 G) R 390 053.73 

                    H) NO BID PRICE 

   

34 SAFIKA CONSTRUCTION A) R 2 964 240.00 

  B) R 799 480.00 

  C) R 6 203 790.00 

  D) R 2 269 065.00 

  E) R 1 968 800.00 

                  F A) R 3 022 890.00 

                   F B) R 3 724 390.00 

  G) R 265 535.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

   

35 VITSHA TRADING A) R 2 615 583.00 

  B) R 524 538.00 

  C) R 4 104 505.50 

  D) R 1 268 041.80 

  E) R 721 337.50 

                 F A) R 1 953 758.00 

                   F B) R 1 956 058.00 

  G) R 248 998.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

36 FANAKA EZIKO JV A) R 4 248 399.00 

  B) R 728 076.50 

  C) R 2 822 514.00 

  D) R 2 991 391.00 

  E) R 1 702 977.50 

  F A) R 3 059 908.50 

  F B) R 3 588 333.50 

                        G) R 262 384.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

37 MAZEMANE TRADING & 
PROJECTS 

A) R 2 768 659.50 

  B) R 453 307.00 

  C) R 2 161 747.00 

  D) R 1 160 470.75 

  E) R 348 881.25 

  F A) R 1 239 280.25 



  F B) R 1 165 680.25 

  G) R 198 475.50 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

38 ASATICO CIVIL & 
CONSTRUCTION 

A) R 2 890 691.88 

  B) R 1 413 561.60 

  C) R 5 717 087.00 

  D) R 1 480 783.70 

  E) R 1 809 605.00 

  F A) R 1 594 459.50 

  F B) R 1 594 212.00 

  G) R 818 725.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

39 NONTEMBISO PROJECTS A) R 5 897 963.75 

  B) NO BID PRICE 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

  F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) NO BID PRICE 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

40 FREE MASON 
CONSTRUCTION 

A) R 1 436 074.00 

  B) R 1 436 074.00 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

  F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) R 99 739.50 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

41 GINTI CC A) R 1 894 314.50 

  B) R 592 227.00 

  C) NO BID PRICE 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F A) NO BID PRICE 

  F B) NO BID PRICE 

  G) R 213 129.50 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

42 ONU INVESTMENT A) R 2 337 535.78 

  B) R 5 79 312.04 

  C) R 2 476 619.88 

  D) R 1 139 004.85 



  E) R 1 618 855.00 

  F A) R 1 887 016.78 

  F B) R 1 512 482.57 

  G) R198 107.05 

  H) R 11 748 933.96 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED  
42 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 50 

Description 

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STEEL METER PILLARS, POLYETHYLENE 

DOUBLE DOOR METER ENCLOSURES AND POLE MOUNTED METER 

BOXES FOR A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS. 

Date of advert 25 October 2019 

Closing date 26 November 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 ARB ELECTRICAL A) R 1 827 528.60 

  B) R 1 745 691.20 

  C) R 25 070.40 

   

2 MEMOTEK TRADING A) R 2 547 178.70 

  B) R 1 728 976.70 

  C) R 17 836.50 

   

3 M3 YAM CIVIL A) R 2 405 484.00 

  B) R 3 040 291.80 

  C) R 32 998.84 

   

4 VOLTEX A) R 2 561 538.60 

  B) R 4 025 020.80 

  C) R 19 887.60 

   

5 POWER PROCESS SYSTEMS A) R 2 095 803.14 

  B) R 3 293 197.50 

  C) R 16 272.27 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 05 
 

 


