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TENDER NUMBER CE 366 

Description 

THE APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF SPECIALIST SERVICE PROVIDERS TO 

SUPPLY, INSTALL AND COMMISSION AIR QUALITY MONITORING 

STATION EQUIPMENT FOR A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS. 

Date of advert 06 September 2019 

Closing date 08 October 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 C & M CONSULTING A) R 248 412.00 

  B) R 268 570.00 

  C) R 250 482.00 

  D) R 109 710.00 

  E) R 92 303.75 

  F) R 231 472.00 

  G) R 643 103.00 

  H) NO BID PRICE 

   

2 UMOYA NILU A) R 212 536.38 

  B) R 222 291.04 

  C) R 188 930.72 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) NO BID PRICE 

  F) R 197 792.80 

  G) R 441 085.70 

   

3 SI ANALYTICS A) R 264 697.40 

  B) R 292 435.40 

  C) R 239 006.40 

  D) NO BID PRICE 

  E) R 50 177.03 

  F) R 187 003.40 

  G) R 457 544.62 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED  
03 

 

 

 

 



TENDER NUMBER CE 367 

Description 

THE APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO SERVICE, REPAIR AND 

CALIBRATE AIR QUALITY MONITORING INSTRUMENTS AND NOISE 

MONITORING INSTRUMENTS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 06 September 2019 

Closing date 08 October 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 C & M CONSULTING A) R 1 754 808.00 

  B) R 929 834.80 

    F) R 281 646.50 

  G) R 164 634.00 

   

2 SI ANALYTICS A) R 166 507.24 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 02 
 

 

 

 

TENDER NUMBER CE 340 

Description 

TWO SERVICE PROVIDERS TO SUPPLY AND DELIVER SPORT APPAREL, 

CONSUMABLES FOR SPORT DEVELOPMENT FOR A PERIOD OF THREE 

YEARS 

Date of advert 20 September 2019 

Closing date 22 October 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 LIMAR HOLDINGS NO PRICE ON FORM OF OFFER 

2 XAMZA SOLUTIONS R 1 965 000.62 (WORDS) 

  R 19065.62 (NUMBERS) 

3 RIOSIN PTY LTD R 1 855 882.00 

4 HMC TRADING R 2 262 571.25 

5 UBUNTU SPORTS R 10 465 745.00 

6 DAMFIN GENERAL TRADING R 3 562 585.00 

7 ZN SIHOLA TRADING R 29 852 211.45 

8 L2K TRADING R 4 600 619.57 

9 MOGAL EMPIRE R 4 611 313.24 

10 KM SPORTS R 1 998 275.00 

11 THE SUPPLY SPORT R 6 580 383.29 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 11 
 

 



 

TENDER NUMBER CE 77 

Description 

TESTING AND MAINTENANCE OF THE ELECTRICAL PROTECTION 

SCHEMES WITHIN THE BCMM AREA OF SUPPLY FOR A PERIOD OF 

THREE YEARS 

Date of advert 27 September 2019 

Closing date 29 October 2019 

Number of bids Name of Bidder Price Quoted 

1 EYABANTU R 5 971 304.11 

   

TOTAL BIDS RECEIVED 01 
 

 

 


